
Shannon Vista Community 
The Shannon Vista HOA Board and Braesael Management would like to 
kindly remind all residents to please pickup and properly dispose of pet 
waste. We would like to thank Shannon Vista residents for their efforts in 
maintaining a safe and charming community. Please see the governing 
documents below regarding pets in the community: 

 

Section 10. Pets.  

(a) No animals shall be raised, bred or kept on any Lot or the Common 
Area, except that dogs, cats, or other household pets may be kept or 
maintained provided that they are not kept or maintained for commercial 
purposes. The total number of household pets generally considered to be 
outdoor pets, such as dogs, cats, et cetera, shall not exceed three (3) in 
number except for newborn offspring of such household pets which are 
under six (6) months of age. No animal shall be allowed in the Project if 
such animal constitutes an unreasonable annoyance, inconvenience or 
nuisance to any other Owner. If the Board receives any complaint that an 
animal constitutes an unreasonable annoyance, inconvenience or 
nuisance, the Board shall afford the Owner of such animal Notice and 
Opportunity for Hearing, and if the Board finds that such animal; constitutes 
an unreasonable annoyance, inconvenience or nuisance, the Board may 
require that such animal be  

removed from the Project.  

(b) The Board may adopt Rules and Regulations concerning animals which 
are more restrictive than the provisions of this Declaration, including rules 
requiring that all animals be kept on a leash when in the Common Area and 
that animals be restricted to designated areas within the Common Area and 
that Owners are responsible for cleaning up any mess that a pet creates 
within the Property. The Board may adopt a rule prohibiting certain pets, 
which is more restrictive than the provisions of this Declaration, except that 
such rule shall not apply to animals residing in the Project at the time such 
rule is adopted. In any event, the Board at any time may require that any 
animal found to be an unreasonable annoyance, inconvenience or 
nuisance be moved as provided in paragraph (a) above. 


